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COPYRIGHT

©Copyright 1992 -1996 G. L. Liadis Software, Inc. All Rights Reserved. This document may not, in whole or part, be copied,
photocopied, translated, or reduced to any electronic medium or machine readable form, without prior consent, in writing, from G. L.
Liadis Software, Inc. All software described in this manual is ©Copyright 1992 -1996 G. L. Liadis Software, Inc. All rights reserved.
The distribution and sale of these products are intended for the use of the original purchaser only. Lawful users of these programs are
hereby licensed only to read the programs, from their media into memory of a computer, solely for the purpose of executing the
programs on one machine at a time. Duplicating or copying for other than backup purposes, or selling or otherwise distributing these
products is a violation of the law and this agreement.

DISCLAIMER

THIS INFORMATION IS PROVIDED "AS IS" WITHOUT REPRESENTATION OR WARRANTY OF ANY KIND, EITHER
EXPRESS OR IMPLIED, INCLUDING WITHOUT LIMITATION, ANY REPRESENTATIONS OR ENDORSEMENTS
REGARDING THE USE OF, THE RESULTS OF, OR PERFORMANCE OF THE INFORMATION, ITS
APPROPRIATENESS, ACCURACY, RELIABILITY, OR CURRENTNESS. THE ENTIRE RISK AS TO THE USE OF THIS
INFORMATION IS ASSUMED BY THE USER. IN NO EVENT WILL G. L. LIADIS SOFTWARE, INC, G. L. LIADIS &
ASSOCIATES. OR IT'S EMPLOYEES BE LIABLE FOR ANY DAMAGES, DIRECT, INDIRECT, INCIDENTAL OR
CONSEQUENTIAL, RESULTING FROM ANY DEFECT IN THE INFORMATION, EVEN IF G. L. LIADIS SOFTWARE, INC
OR G. L. LIADIS & ASSOCIATES HAVE BEEN ADVISED OF THE POSSIBILITY OF SUCH DAMAGES. THIS
DISCLAIMER SHALL SUPERSEDE ANY VERBAL OR WRITTEN STATEMENT TO THE CONTRARY. IF YOU DO NOT
ACCEPT THESE TERMS YOU MUST CEASE AND DESIST USING THIS PRODUCT.

LICENSE AGREEMENT

Your use of this package indicates your acceptance of the following terms and conditions:

1. Copyright: These programs and the related documentation are copyright. The sole owner is G. L. Liadis Software, Inc. You may
not use, copy, modify, or transfer the programs, documentation, or any copy except as expressly provided in this agreement.

2. License: You have the non-exclusive right to use any enclosed program only on a single computer at a time. You may load the
program into your computers temporary memory (RAM). You may physically transfer the program from one computer to another,
provided that the program is used on only one computer at a time. You may not distribute copies of the complete Registered package
or the accompanying documentation to others. You may not decompile, disassemble, reverse engineer, modify, or translate the
program or the documentation. You may not attempt to unlock or bypass any copy protection utilized with the program. All other
rights and uses not specifically granted in this license are reserved by
G. L. Liadis Software, Inc and/or G. L. LIADIS & ASSOCIATES

3. Back-up and Transfer: You may make one (1) copy of the program solely for back-up purposes. You must reproduce and include
the copyright notice on the back-up copy. You may transfer the product to another party only if the other party agrees to the terms and
conditions of this agreement and completes and returns a registration card to G. L. LIADIS & ASSOCIATES. If you transfer the
program you must at the same time transfer the documentation and back-up copy or transfer the documentation and destroy the back-
up copy.

4. Terms: This license is effective until terminated. You may terminate it by destroying the program, the documentation and copies
thereof. This license will also terminate if you fail to comply with any terms or conditions of this agreement. You agree upon such
termination to destroy all copies of the program and of the documentation.
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